
SUMMER 2019 MUSICAL THEATRE PREPARATORY PROGRAM
REGISTRATION FORM

     This full day musical theatre training program is for students entering grades 3 – 8. It runs
weekdays July 15th-26th, from 9 – 3:30 pm.  Each day students have a schedule of classes
and rehearsals for Alice in Wonderland. Broadway guest artists will also provide special master
classes for the students.  The emphasis of the program is on developing strong performance
technique.  As part of that goal, each student will be featured in the final performance as a
singer, actor and dancer.  Students will also have time to develop their own creative projects
and perform them for the rest of the program each Friday.

Student’s name:_________________________________________   Phone:_____________________________

Email:_________________________________________________   Grade:___________  Age:_____________

Mailing Address:____________________________________State:________________Zip:_________________

PAYMENT:

_____ $675 if you register and pay in full before May 1.

_____ $725 for registration paid in full after May 1.

_____ $725 paid in two installments: $350 due upon registration, $375 due Monday, July 9.

● Sibling Discount: Pay the full amount for the first child.  Save 10% for all additional children.

Class Fees:_________________ - Discounts:__________________ = Amount Due____________________

☐ Cash   ☐ Credit Card   ☐  Check (Check #____________)  Checks Payable to Playhouse Theatre Group, Inc.

If Credit:   ☐ Visa   ☐ Master card   ☐ Discover

Credit Card number:__________________________________________________  Exp:__________________

Each student receives one free T-shirt during the summer of 2016.

SIZE (Circle One): Child S     Child M     Child L     Child XL     Adult S     Adult M     Adult L

☐  Check here to be added to the mailing list.

Any requests for refund must be made in writing before the Wednesday prior to the first day of the
program.  Refunds will not be made after that Wednesday.  I agree to these terms:

Parent’s name (print):________________________________  Parent’s Signature:_________________________

Bring completed form and payment to the box office, or mail to:
Educational Programs c/o Playhouse on Park, 244 Park Road, West Hartford, CT 06119

Questions?  Call the box office at (860) 523 – 5900 x 10 or visit www.playhouseonpark.org.

* PLEASE VISIT THE WEBSITE FOR THE FACULTY AND OTHER INFORMATION.



Waiver / Photo / Injury Release Form

I grant Playhouse Theatre Group, Inc., its subsidiary Playhouse on Park, representatives and
employees the right to take photographs and video of me in connection with the above-identified
subject.

I authorize Playhouse Theatre Group, Inc., its assigns and transferees to Copyright, use and
publish the same in print and/or electronically. I agree that Playhouse Theatre Group, Inc. may
use such photographs of me with or without my name and for any lawful purpose, including for
example such purposes and publicity, illustration, advertising and Web content.

I understand that dance, theatre and vocal instruction requires physical exertion. I also
acknowledge that injury may result during instruction, including but not limited to as a result of
physical contact with other students, instructors, or fixed or movable objects, or the condition of
the floor. I represent that I am medically and physically able to safely participate in dance and/or
theatre classes, workshops, rehearsals, and performances and to meet the physical demands
thereof. I agree to assume all risks associated with participating in dance and/or theatre
instruction, workshops, rehearsals, and performances at or in connection with Playhouse
Theatre Group, Inc. If, at any time hereafter, I have any medical or physical limitation or
condition that might affect my ability to safely participate in dance and/or theatre classes,
workshops, rehearsals, or performances, or meet the physical demands required thereof, I will
make such limitations and conditions immediately known to Playhouse Theatre Group, Inc.

I grant consent for any PTG, Inc. instructor to apply physical contact to the student for the
purpose of making any technical correction that is appropriate for dance instruction according to
accepted artistic practices.

In view of the foregoing, and as a term and condition of receiving dance, theatre, and/or vocal
instruction at Playhouse on Park, I, for myself, my spouse, heirs, legal representatives and
assigns, expressly release, waive and discharge Playhouse Theatre Group, Inc., its officers,
directors, employees, agents, successors, predecessors, sponsors, legal representatives and
assigns, from all present and future claims, demands, actions, judgments, executions and
liabilities of any kind, known or unknown, that now have, ever had or may have, or claim to
have, against Playhouse Theatre Group, Inc., its officers, directors, employees, agents,
successors, predecessors, sponsors, legal representatives and assigns, created by, as arising
out of, any dance or theatre instruction, workshop, rehearsal, performance or related activity,
regardless of where held or when held, even though such claim or liability may arise out of
negligence or fault on the part of any of the foregoing persons or entities, breach of contract or
otherwise, and whether for bodily injury, property damages or loss or otherwise. This release is
for the entire premises of Playhouse on Park, including but not limited to the stage, dressing
rooms, lobby, audience, bathrooms, sidewalks, stairwells, buildings and grounds.

Name of participant/student: _____________________________________________

Name of parent/guardian: _______________________________________________

Signature: ____________________________________________________________


